
Bods feeding Bods
food & commodities pantry

MORE INFO: EMAIL TECHADVOCATE@WASHBURN.EDU OR CALL (785) 670.3348

PICK UP: Once the order form 
is processed, your box of items 
will be available at either the 
Huntoon campus, Washburn 
Tech East or Washburn Tech 
Academy of Cosmetology. 
Recipients will be notified, 
via email, regarding when and 
where your box is available. It 
will be labeled with your WIN 
number. GED students should 
contact the Campus Advocate 
to receive a special ID number.

Again, there is NO COSTNO COST! This 
is a free service for members 
of the Washburn family. Just 
bring your Washburn ID and be 
prepared to show it at pick up.

WHO: All Washburn Tech
students, instructors & staff

WHAT: A food pantry that 
helps to address the health and 
well-being of all members of 
the Washburn family. It was 
established to alleviate hunger 
and poor nutrition issues. AND, 
it is free!

WHEN: Fall 2022/Spring 2023

WHERE: Washburn Tech

HOW: Fill out a pantry order 
form, which is available in the 
Washburn Tech Main Office. 
Once complete, scan or take a 
photo of the form and send it to 
our Campus Advocate at
techadvocate@washburn.edu.techadvocate@washburn.edu.


